
To: Deedee Bow[dbow@xanterra.com]
Cc: Cindy Purcell[cindy_purcell@nps.gov]; Camp, Terry[terry.camp@mail.house.gov]
From: Thiele, Aaron
Sent: 2018-09-21T15:44:27-04:00
Importance: Normal
Subject: Re: Zion Lodge Lunch Bill
Received: 2018-09-21T15:44:39-04:00

Deedee,

We will not be needing the lunch or coffee and tea in the morning, but can you please send Terry

(Cc'd) and invoice for the room set-up fee as soon as you can and the Committee can make sure

that it gets paid.

Thanks,

Aaron

On Fri, Sep 21, 2018 at 2:13 PM Purcell, Cynthia <cindy_purcell@nps.gov> wrote:

Aaron:

As you mentioned over the phone with Jeff Bradybaugh and I, we anticipate that the DOI will

pay for this service. Attached is the breakdown of service for AM coffee/tea and Sandwich

Buffet.  Please work directly with Deedee Bow (copied) for payment.

Thank you.

--

Cindy J. Purcell
Management Assistant

Zion National Park
435-772-0172

FOIA001:03390235


